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(b) CGPA Calculation of the Programme:An Illustrative Example

Semester I II III IV

Credits of the semester 24 24 28 24

SGPA 7.00 8.50 9.20 6.86

=
(24 × 7.00 + 24 × 8.50 + 28 × 9.20 + 24 × 6.86)

100
= ?7.94CGPA

 Based on the secured letter grades, 
grade points, SGPA and CGPA, a grade card for each 
semester and a consolidated grade card indicating the 

performance in all semesters shall be issued. ?

Conversion formula for the conversion of CGPA into 
percentage is given below:

Percentage of marks secured, 

P = [CGPA Earned - 0.75] × 10

Illustration for a CGPA of 8.20:

P = [CGPA Earned 8.2 - 0.75]× 10 = 74.5 % 

After the conversion of final CGPA into percentage 
of marks  (P), a graduating student is  reckoned to 
have passed in   

(i) First Class with Distinction (FCD) if P = 70% 

(ii) First Class (FC) if   P = 60% but <70% and 

(iii) Second Class (SC) if P < 60%.   

There shall be a maximum of 40 CIE Marks in each 
theory.

A candidate shall obtain not less than 50% of the 
maximum marks prescribed for the CIE of each 
Theory course/ Internship /Project/Dissertation. [To 
be read along with 18OMB8.8]

18OMB6.3 Grade Card:

18OMB7.0 Conversions of Grades into Percentage and Class 
Equivalence

18OMB7.1 Conversions of Grades into Percentage 

18OMB7.2 Class Equivalence:

18OMB8.0 Continuous Internal Evaluation and Semester 
End Evaluation

18OMB8.1

18OMB8.2

18OMB8.3

18OMB8.4

18OMB8.5

18OMB8.6

18OMB8.7

18OMB8.8

CIE Marks shall be based on 

a) Tests (for 25Marks) and 

b) Assignments, Quiz, Simulation, Experimentation, 
Mini project, oral examination, field work etc., (for 
15 Marks)conducted in respective courses.

The CIE marks in a theory course, for 25 marks, shall 
be based on two tests covering the entire syllabus. An 
additional test may be conducted for the needy 
students to provide an opportunity to improve their 
CIE Marks before the end of the semester. The CIE 
marks shall be the average of the marks scored in at 
least two of the above tests.

The candidates shall write the Tests in Blue Book/s. 
The Blue book/s and other documents relating to 
award of CIE marks under 18OMB8.2 (b) shall be 
preserved by the Principal / Head of the Department 
for at least six months from the date of  
announcement of University results and made 
available for verification at the directions of the 
Registrar (Evaluation).

Every page of the CIE marks list shall bear the 
signatures of the concerned Teacher, Head of the 
Department and the Principal.

The CIE marks list shall be displayed on the Notice 
Board and corrections, if any, shall be incorporated 
before submitting to the University.

The CIE marks shall be sent to the university by the 
Pr inc ipa ls  wel l  in  advance  before  the  
commencement of Semester End Examinations. No 
corrections of the CIE marks shall be entertained 
after the submission of marks list to the University.

Candidates obtaining less than 50% of the CIE marks 
in any course (Theory/Internship/Project) shall not 
be eligible to appear for the University examination 
in that course/s. In such cases, the Head of the 
Department shall arrange for the improvement of 
CIE marks in the course when offered in the 
subsequent semester subject to the provision of 
18OMB1.5.
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