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Acknowledgement - ALVAS INSTITUTE OF ENGINEERING & TECHNOLOGY

Chitra Kirubashankar <chitracsiedaccounts@yahoo.com> Sat, Nov 17, 2018 at 1:30 AM

To: HARISH KUNDER <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in>, Admn Officer <admn.officer@csi-india.org>
Cc: miraclincsimembership@gmail.com

Dear Professor,

This is to acknowledge the receipt of Rs.180/- in our Axis bank a/c on 16-11-18. You will be hearing from
membership department shortly.

With Regards,

Chitra.K

Accounts Executive
Computer Society of India,
Chennai

On Saturday, 17 November, 2018, 12:20:02 PM IST, HARISH KUNDER <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in> wrote:
Dear Sir,
with reference to your email dated 15th November 2018, i am hereby attaching the following documents along with this mail

1. Application for Renewal of Academic Institutional Membership. IM fee for one year is Rs.7,080 ( Payment details attached)

Transaction Date |Description Transaction Amount(INR)
17/10/2018|NEFT/AXISP00017052135/

0117101837501/CSI EDUCATION 6,900.00

16/11/2018|NEFT Ref No: P18111614319875 180.00

2. Completed application for opening a student branch (Format attached -Form-Ill) Accreditation fee for 75 students fee for one year is
Rs.7,080

Transaction Date:  17/10/2018
Description: [FT/01171018389/1
Transaction Amount(INR): 18,750.00
3. 75 Student details in the excel sheet (Format attached - Form-ll - Bulk upload template)
I am hereby requesting you to process the same and let me know if any mistakes in the above said applications and will send the
A3\ hardcopy of the application through courier

I hope you will do the needful
Thanking you

On Thu, Nov 15, 2018 at 3:51 AM admn officer <admn.officer@csi-india.org> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Greetings

This is to acknowledge the receipt of the following payment mentioned in your mail. Kindly arrange for the following to process your
application

1. IM fee for one year is Rs.7,080. Kindly arrange to send the shortage payment Rs.180/- (Fees details attached)

2. Kindly arrange to send the completed application (Form-l) Format attached

3. Three free nominee members will be provided by CSI. Kindly arrange to send the three nominee members details in Form-li
3. Completed application for opening a student branch (Format attached -Form-lIil)

4. 75 Student details in the excel sheet (Format attached - Form-lll - Bulk upload template)

Your application will be processed on receipt of the following mentioned above

Regards,
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M. Gnanasekaran

Manager (Administration)

Computer Society of India

Education Directorate

C I T Campus, 4th Cross Road
Taramani, Chennai - 600 113

Phone : +91-44-2254 1102/1103/2874

——— Forwarded message ---------
: From: AVINASH <finance@aiet.org.in>
Date: Tue, Nov 13, 2018 at 8:33 PM

Subject: Re: Accredited Student Wing - Student Branch
To: Harish Kundar AIET <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in>

On Thu, Nov 15, 2018 at 4:21 PM HARISH KUNDER <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in> wrote:

Transaction Date |Description

Transaction Amount(INR)

| 17/10/2018|NEFT/AXISP00017052135/
0117101837501/CSI EDUCATION

6,900.00

)

17/10/2018(IFT/01171018389/1

18,750.00

------- -- Forwarded message ---------

Date: Tue, Nov 13, 2018, 15:39

--—------ Forwarded message ---------
Date: Wed, Feb 28, 2018, 09:53

To: <harishkunder@aiet.org.in>

Dear Professor,

Greetings From CSI-ED.

Attachment as stated below:

1.Application for adding new Student.

Fee chart revised:

Subject: Fwd: Accredited Student Wing - Student Branch
To: HARISH KUNDER <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in>

From: CSI Promotions <csipromotions@csi-india.org>

Subject: Accredited Student Wing - Student Branch

From: Prof. Harish Kunder Alvas IT Moodbidri <harishkunder@aiet.org.in>

On Tue, 13 Nov 2018 at 15:40, HARISH KUNDER <emscoordinator@aiet.org.in> wrote:

2.CSV template (Excel Sheet) for filling up the student name who have enrolled.

It is mandatory to maintain CSI Student Branch minimum strength of 75 at all times.

With reference to your mail, we forward herewith the required for adding new student to your CSI Student Wing.

For example if a student wish to enrol for one year need to pay Rs.350/-as one year fee, out of their amount Rs.250/-
need to be sent to CSI and Rs.100/- to be kept by the college and spent towards CS| Activity.(Activities Fund).

Accreditation Fee for the Institutions (Students Wing)
Number of Years 1Yr 2 Yrs 3 Yrs 4 Yrs 15Yrs | 25Yrs | 3.5Yrs
For every Accredited Student 350 650 900 1100 550 850 1,050
Activity Grant to the Institution 100 200 250 350 150 250 300
Payable to CSI 250 450 650 © 750 400 600 750
i i
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Computer Society of India™
Education Directorate

APPLICATION ¥OR
RENEWAL OF ACADEMIC INSTITUTIONAL MEMBERSHIP
Date 37.\@\3‘@;53 :
INSTITUTIONAL INFORMATION - {PLEASE FILL IN CAPTIAL LETTERS)
CStinstitutional Membership No. WM \O LTE Ly "
CSE Membership Expiry Date o A *w:ﬁ%»i« QoYY
Renewal applied till Date Bugugdy 9619 Period of Membership | 1 yeay
Name of the Institution ALVAS I NSTITUTE OF ENGULy 2 TECR.
Postal Address M THR MAN A LORE PRISHINA WANADA
City / PinCode SOh 229
State ¥XARNATAHKA

NOMINATING AUTHORITY - Head of the Institution

Or. / Prof: / Mrse/ Mr=/ Ms. - Name : PETER FERNPARNDES

Designation PRxwcex AL 9 PRoFEScap

Mobile Phone : AR L4S5 D SO ALK

Email ID Primcipedier 08 @ gwed ) com
NOMINEE MEMBER - 1

Existing Member 1D F 900 3671

0{1 Prof. /Mrs./Mr. /Ms.-Name: | Dyg. MANTON ﬁTH K @Tﬁ RT:

Mobile Phone Cﬂ-{wlf—f‘{ 3’8’6 008 :

Email 1D

| MKOTART (A Govass |- com

 NOMINEE MEMBER - 2

Existing Member 1D O L2468

or./ h}ge/n 2 odas Sho

Mobile Phone 2SS 13950

Email ID

sha *Sya £ gwmonlccom

Existing Member

B Prof. [ Mrs:

Mobile Phone

Email 1D
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PAYMENT INFORMATION

Online Transaction No.

NEFT IR2TSC 000 1N0S Q135 [foliN10183

it ot 5 LS DS 255, s g Ehusat San
o v lielxe®
Cheque / DD No.
| Issuing Bank Name fAXS BanNK.
| Branch Name, City MooD BT DR
ENDORSEMENT BY HEAD OF THE INSTITUTION
7

, Taramani, Chennai - 600113
1103, 044-2254 1143
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